
 

 
 
 
DATE: BID TITLE & REFERENCE: 
March 6, 2014       Smallwares for School Cafeterias, RFP #141203 
 
DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE: 

 
An annual pricing agreement to provide kitchen smallware items as stocked and distributed by the 
Central Warehouse for school cafeterias throughout the District.  One hundred and eight (108) items 
bid and one hundred and one (101) items are awarded.  Items will be purchased as needed to meet 
cafeteria smallware supply needs.  
 
Effective Dates:  April 1, 2014 through March 31, 2015. 
 
 
 
 

  
REQUESTED BY: 

 
Food Services 
 

    
SUPPLIER NAME:       ITEMS AWARDED: ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXPENDITURE: 

 
Calico Industries, Longwood, FL     13            $ 4,500.00 
Culinary Depot, Monsey, NY      9     2,000.00 
Hotel & Restaurant Supply, Meridian, MS    9     3,000.00 
International Restaurant Dist., Apopka, FL    8     3,000.00 
Johnson-Lancaster, Clearwater, FL     7   12,800.00 
Pueblo Hotel Supply, Pueblo, CO     7     1,000.00 
Sam Tell & Son, Farmingdale, NY   14     7,000.00 
Supreme Paper Supplies, Pensacola, FL  34     3,200.00 

 
 
    
AMOUNT OF PURCHASE: FUNDING SOURCE: 

 
$36,500.00 Est. / Yr.   Food Services Fund (4110) 
     

  
METHOD OF PROCUREMENT: 

 
ECSD Bid                                                 Responses Received:  9                 Responses Rejected:  0 
 

  
DATE AND TIME POSTED: 

 
March 6, 2014, 3:45 pm CST 

 
 
9500PUR101 (11/10) Retention - 5 Years 

 
THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY 

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 
75 North Pace Boulevard 

Pensacola, FL  32505 
 

BID AWARD NOTICE 



DATE: January 24, 2014

BID NBR:  141203
BID TITLE: Smallwares for School Cafeterias

Where two prices are shown, the top price is the bid case/order unit as listed in the RFP.
Bottom price is unit price needed to determine low cost because of vendor differences in pack sizes.

ITEM Oven Mitts Oven Mitts
Standard Puppet Style

Quantity: 5 ea 50 ea 50 ea 25 ea
0750503 0710300 0750281 0750280

ITEM NUMBER 1 2 3 4

Calico Industries 25.44 u 1.44 2.22 a 31.43 a
Longwood, FL Blade only u u

Culinary Depot 156.49 No Bid 16.91 9.45 a
Monsey, NY 1.409

Hotel & Restaurant Supply 225.00 2.80 a 16.95 m 9.46
Meridian, MS u u

International Rest. Dist. 253.36 2.48 a 14.40 u 10.12
Apopka, FL u

Johnson-Lancaster 127.45 17.76 a 17.49 9.76
Clearwater, FL u 1.458

Pueblo Hotel Supply 25.27 u 2.87 17.42 9.73
Pueblo, CO Blade only 1.452

Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tampa, FL

Sam Tell & Son 101.25 No Bid 2.66 6.68
Farmingdale, NY
Supreme Paper Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.46 a
Pensacola, FL u

Not Awarded

W/6 Sect. Blade

Awarded Items are highlighted

Fruit/Veg Wedger Pot Holder

THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

75 NORTH PACE BOULEVARD
PENSACOLA, FLORIDA 32505

BID TABULATION

Page 1



ITEM Freezer Single
Gloves Egg Slicer Manual

Quantity: 50 ea 50 ea 15 ea 25 ea
0750262 0750230 0799026 N 0730092 N

ITEM NUMBER 5 6 7 8
Calico Industries 9.84 3.28 a 2.63 N 32.88 N
Longwood, FL u Y u
Culinary Depot No Bid No Bid 2.03 N No Bid
Monsey, NY Y
Hotel & Restaurant Supply 15.05 a No Bid 5.63 N 378.00 N
Meridian, MS Y Y u
International Rest. Dist. 13.95 a 16.99 a 6.36 N 436.00 N
Apopka, FL u u Y u
Johnson-Lancaster 12.28 a No Bid 2.14 N No Bid
Clearwater, FL Y Y
Pueblo Hotel Supply 15.46 a 8.60 a 3.32 N 5.22 N
Pueblo, CO u u u
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tampa, FL
Sam Tell & Son 9.84 a 5.295 a 2.00 N 110.20 N
Farmingdale, NY Y u Y u
Supreme Paper Supplies 13.38 a No Bid 2.17 N No Bid
Pensacola, FL u Y

Not Awarded Not Awarded

ITEM Knife Knife, Chef's Knife
Electric Chef's, 8 in. 10 in. Bread

Quantity: 25 ea 20 ea 20 ea 20 ea
0730093 N 0730070 0730090 0730080

ITEM NUMBER 9 10 11 12
Calico Industries 398.98 N 7.15 a 7.98 a 5.18 a
Longwood, FL u Y u u
Culinary Depot 388.80 N 8.79 a 10.34 a 6.35 a
Monsey, NY u u u
Hotel & Restaurant Supply 453.00 N 18.18 a 20.09 a 15.37 a
Meridian, MS u u u
International Rest. Dist. 221.25 N 21.25 23.25 17.59
Apopka, FL u
Johnson-Lancaster 336.24 N 21.56 a 23.80 a 18.93 a
Clearwater, FL u u u u
Pueblo Hotel Supply 379.08 N 18.71 20.66 16.16 u
Pueblo, CO u
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tampa, FL
Sam Tell & Son 374.40 N 16.48 18.27 14.23 u
Farmingdale, NY u
Supreme Paper Supplies No Bid 18.33 a 20.13 15.29 u
Pensacola, FL u

Not Awarded

Knife Sharpener

Cutting Gloves Knife Sharpener
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ITEM Knife Knife
3-1/4" Utility, 6" Rack 4" Diameter

Quantity: 20 ea 20 ea 40 ea 20 ea
0730050 0730060 0730091 0799018 N

ITEM NUMBER 13 14 15 16
Calico Industries 2.80 a 3.19 a 19.84 a 1.73 N
Longwood, FL u Y u Y
Culinary Depot 4.86 a 4.71 a No Bid 1.38 N
Monsey, NY u u u
Hotel & Restaurant Supply 3.78 a 5.05 a 50.45 N 13.66 N
Meridian, MS u u u
International Rest. Dist. 4.96 9.97 14.64 N 16.50 N
Apopka, FL Y Y
Johnson-Lancaster 4.48 a 8.09 a 54.81 N 1.59 N
Clearwater, FL u u Y
Pueblo Hotel Supply 3.89 a 7.02 a 11.74 N 11.71 N
Pueblo, CO u u u
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tampa, FL
Sam Tell & Son 4.28 a 7.73 a 39.78 N 1.78 N
Farmingdale, NY u u u
Supreme Paper Supplies 5.50 a 9.08 a No Bid 14.36 Y
Pensacola, FL u u 1.86 Y

ITEM
16" 18" 16"

Quantity: 5 ea 10 ea 10 ea 10 ea
770801 0799052 0799047 0799054

ITEM NUMBER 17 18 19 20
Calico Industries 10.83 2.30 2.78 2.88
Longwood, FL
Culinary Depot 9.75 2.03 2.44 2.58
Monsey, NY
Hotel & Restaurant Supply 12.85 2.18 2.62 2.78
Meridian, MS
International Rest. Dist. 12.55 2.33 2.80 2.96
Apopka, FL
Johnson-Lancaster 9.91 2.06 2.48 2.63
Clearwater, FL
Pueblo Hotel Supply 10.26 2.14 2.57 2.72
Pueblo, CO
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tampa, FL
Sam Tell & Son 9.50 2.03 a 2.43 a 2.47
Farmingdale, NY u u
Supreme Paper Supplies 10.45 2.18 2.62 2.77
Pensacola, FL

Pizza Cutter

Pizza Dockers Pizza Screens Pizza Screens Pizza Pans

Knife, Paring
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ITEM Turner Sandwich Cutting Boards
18" Hamburger Spreaders White 15" x 20"

Quantity: 10 ea 20 ea 10 ea 10 ea
0799053 0799121 N 0740120 0799030

ITEM NUMBER 21 22 23 24
Calico Industries 3.49 9.57 N 1.95 20.13
Longwood, FL u
Culinary Depot 3.13 7.57 N 2.72 a 20.44
Monsey, NY u u
Hotel & Restaurant Supply 3.36 14.84 N 2.27 a 20.45
Meridian, MS Y u
International Rest. Dist. 3.96 17.70 N 2.96 a 24.63
Apopka, FL Y
Johnson-Lancaster 3.18 17.11 N 2.29 21.12
Clearwater, FL u
Pueblo Hotel Supply 3.29 15.26 N 2.31 a 20.75 a
Pueblo, CO u u u
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tampa, FL
Sam Tell & Son 2.99 10.81 N 1.99 a 18.98
Farmingdale, NY u Y
Supreme Paper Supplies 3.36 2.34 N 0.92 a 8.12 a
Pensacola, FL Y Y Y

ITEM
Storage Stand

Quantity: 10 ea 25 ea 25 ea 10 ea
0799021 0799074 0799050 0799039

ITEM NUMBER 25 26 27 28
Calico Industries 20.13 6.39 10.73 21.62
Longwood, FL
Culinary Depot 20.45 5.68 10.37 19.39
Monsey, NY
Hotel & Restaurant Supply 20.45 6.10 10.45 21.74
Meridian, MS
International Rest. Dist. 24.63 8.15 13.00 23.00
Apopka, FL
Johnson-Lancaster 21.12 5.95 10.63 20.29
Clearwater, FL
Pueblo Hotel Supply 22.65 a 5.98 10.73 20.41
Pueblo, CO u
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tampa, FL
Sam Tell & Son 18.98 6.65 9.98 22.68
Farmingdale, NY
Supreme Paper Supplies 8.27 a 6.09 No Bid 20.10
Pensacola, FL Y

Cutting Board Cutting Board Cutting Board Scales

Pizza Pans

Hanging Rack HooksGreen 15" x 20" 32 oz. Capacity
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ITEM
5 lb. Capacity Solid 11"

Quantity: 10 ea 50 ea 50 ea 10 ea
0799002 0739512 0739513 0740613

ITEM NUMBER 29 30 31 32
Calico Industries 21.62 2.25 1.29 a 1.69 a
Longwood, FL Y u
Culinary Depot 19.39 6.95 6.95 3.56
Monsey, NY
Hotel & Restaurant Supply 21.74 1.10 a 1.20 a 1.70 a
Meridian, MS Y Y u
International Rest. Dist. 23.00 8.05 8.05 1.96
Apopka, FL
Johnson-Lancaster 20.29 6.89 6.89 1.72 a
Clearwater, FL u
Pueblo Hotel Supply 20.41 7.00 a 4.84 2.51
Pueblo, CO u
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tampa, FL
Sam Tell & Son 21.84 4.66 4.65 2.42 a
Farmingdale, NY u
Supreme Paper Supplies 19.90 4.93 a,y 4.93 a,y 2.55
Pensacola, FL 1.22 a,Y 1.22 a,Y

ITEM Tongs Tongs
12" Salad, 9 "

Quantity: 10 ea 25 ea 15 ea 10 ea
0740612 0740642 0770505 0799153

ITEM NUMBER 33 34 35 36
Calico Industries 3.98 2.58 1.70 0.83 m
Longwood, FL
Culinary Depot 4.20 2.44 1.61 1.26
Monsey, NY
Hotel & Restaurant Supply 2.92 6.77 a 1.63 1.29
Meridian, MS Y
International Rest. Dist. 4.45 2.65 3.23 1.47
Apopka, FL
Johnson-Lancaster 4.24 2.89 1.91 1.28
Clearwater, FL
Pueblo Hotel Supply 4.20 2.44 1.61 1.26
Pueblo, CO
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tampa, FL
Sam Tell & Son 3.85 2.26 1.49 1.20
Farmingdale, NY
Supreme Paper Supplies No Bid 3.41 u 0.66 a 0.77
Pensacola, FL u

Scales Spoodle Spoodle Serving Spoon
Solid, 4 oz. Perforated, 4 oz.

8" Salad/Buffet
Serving Spoon Spoons
Perforated 15"
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ITEM
8" Salad 2 qt. Square 8 qt. Square

Quantity: 10 ea 20 ea 25 ea 25 ea
0799154 0740000 0799260 0799262

ITEM NUMBER 37 38 39 40
Calico Industries 0.94 1.05 3.20 6.05
Longwood, FL
Culinary Depot 1.08 1.32 3.74 5.58
Monsey, NY
Hotel & Restaurant Supply 1.30 1.59 3.85 8.93
Meridian, MS
International Rest. Dist. 1.48 1.80 3.94 9.23
Apopka, FL
Johnson-Lancaster 1.40 0.86 a 3.77 8.75
Clearwater, FL u
Pueblo Hotel Supply 0.76 0.92 2.78 5.57 u
Pueblo, CO
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tampa, FL
Sam Tell & Son 1.19 0.91 a 2.79 5.29
Farmingdale, NY u
Supreme Paper Supplies 1.70 0.94 Y 2.67 a 5.72 a
Pensacola, FL Y Y

ITEM Utility Pail Utility Pail
3-1/2 qt. 6 qt. Green 6 qt., Red Women's

Quantity: 25 ea 50 ea 50 ea 25 pr
0799264 0799321 0799322 0710250 N

ITEM NUMBER 41 42 43 44
Calico Industries 2.91 2.68 2.68 5.84 N
Longwood, FL Y
Culinary Depot 5.08 2.92 2.92 10.14 N
Monsey, NY
Hotel & Restaurant Supply 5.19 3.05 3.05 9.80 N
Meridian, MS Y
International Rest. Dist. 3.46 3.76 3.46 57.90 N
Apopka, FL u
Johnson-Lancaster 5.13 3.31 3.31 53.24 N
Clearwater, FL 4.436 Y
Pueblo Hotel Supply 5.08 2.33 u 2.33 4.38 N
Pueblo, CO Y
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tampa, FL
Sam Tell & Son 3.69 2.33 2.33 10.59 N
Farmingdale, NY u
Supreme Paper Supplies 2.68 2.29 2.29 No Bid
Pensacola, FL

Storage Container

10" Salad/Buffet
Spoons Ladles Storage Containers Storage Containers

Gloves Waterproof
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ITEM Aprons
Men's Scullery 18" x 13" x 1"

Quantity: 25 pr 25 ea 10 ea 30 rls
0710270 N 0730010 0799208 0799083

ITEM NUMBER 45 46 N 47 48
Calico Industries 5.84 N 5.33 N 244.00 4.63 a
Longwood, FL Y u u
Culinary Depot 10.14 N No Bid 478.98 6.46
Monsey, NY
Hotel & Restaurant Supply 10.16 N No Bid 465.00 3.98
Meridian, MS Y
International Rest. Dist. 57.90 N 10.46 N 493.00 7.65
Apopka, FL Y Y
Johnson-Lancaster 53.24 N 15.34 N 243.08 a 5.99 a
Clearwater, FL 4.436 Y Y u Y
Pueblo Hotel Supply 4.38 N 10.80 N 507.15 a 6.46 u
Pueblo, CO Y u u
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tampa, FL
Sam Tell & Son 10.59 N No Bid 484.52 6.10
Farmingdale, NY u
Supreme Paper Supplies No Bid No Bid 162.00 a 6.67 a
Pensacola, FL u u

Not Awarded

ITEM Cooling
holder, 64 oz. Paddle 40 qt. 10 qt.

Quantity: 15 ea 30 ea 10 ea 10 ea
0740302 0799173 0799051 0730844

ITEM NUMBER 49 50 N 51 52
Calico Industries 36.46 27.93 N 37.02 a 44.51
Longwood, FL Y Y
Culinary Depot 48.04 No Bid 69.06 42.91 a
Monsey, NY u
Hotel & Restaurant Supply 48.35 25.45 N 81.20 41.73
Meridian, MS Y
International Rest. Dist. 55.00 31.90 N 78.95 49.06
Apopka, FL Y
Johnson-Lancaster 22.12 27.54 N 68.42 42.52
Clearwater, FL Y
Pueblo Hotel Supply 21.92 26.16 N 69.06 42.91 u
Pueblo, CO Y
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tampa, FL
Sam Tell & Son 47.45 26.74 N 77.52 46.39
Farmingdale, NY Y
Supreme Paper Supplies No Bid No Bid 43.23 a No Bid
Pensacola, FL Y

Gloves Waterproof Baker's Rack Pan, Sheet
22-Pan Capacity

Ice Scoop and Stock Pot, w/lid Sauce Pot, w/lid
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ITEM Ladle Ladle Wire Whisk
2 oz. 4 oz. Transfer Piano 18"

Quantity: 25 ea 50 ea 10 ea 10 ea
0740020 0740030 0740070 0750501

ITEM NUMBER 53 54 55 56
Calico Industries 1.76 a 2.65 a 40.17 7.68
Longwood, FL Y Y
Culinary Depot 9.23 11.66 38.73 7.34
Monsey, NY
Hotel & Restaurant Supply 8.97 11.34 37.67 7.14
Meridian, MS
International Rest. Dist. 9.50 12.00 45.00 8.00
Apopka, FL
Johnson-Lancaster 9.06 11.45 38.02 7.20
Clearwater, FL
Pueblo Hotel Supply 9.43 11.66 44.57 u 7.34
Pueblo, CO
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tampa, FL
Sam Tell & Son 9.15 11.56 38.38 7.13
Farmingdale, NY
Supreme Paper Supplies 1.35 a 2.04 a No Bid 1.58 a
Pensacola, FL Y Y u

ITEM Brush Brush Trays, Flat
Pastry Utility 3 qt. No Logo

Quantity: 25 ea 25 ea 3 ea 20 dz
0740920 0740930 0799270 0760020

ITEM NUMBER 57 58 59 60
Calico Industries 2.91 a 5.55 1,304.00 74.98
Longwood, FL Y
Culinary Depot 6.59 7.62 1,154.56 81.91 a
Monsey, NY u
Hotel & Restaurant Supply 6.55 7.80 805.00 a 81.60
Meridian, MS u
International Rest. Dist. 6.98 3.80 a 1,350.00 95.40
Apopka, FL u
Johnson-Lancaster 4.58 5.29 1,280.79 72.00
Clearwater, FL
Pueblo Hotel Supply 4.55 5.26 1,443.20 72.72
Pueblo, CO 6.06
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tampa, FL
Sam Tell & Son 5.72 5.11 1,124.88 65.40
Farmingdale, NY
Supreme Paper Supplies 2.23 a 5.42 1,159.05 a 69.34
Pensacola, FL Y u

Ladle

Food Processor
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ITEM Trays Pan, Plastic Pans, Plastic Pans, Plastic
Half Size Full Size 1/6 Size

Quantity: 75 dz. 10 ea 10 ea 10 ea
0799174 0799267 0799268 0730870

ITEM NUMBER 61 62 63 64
Calico Industries 39.63 7.07 10.16 2.73
Longwood, FL
Culinary Depot 96.10 8.19 13.10 3.89
Monsey, NY
Hotel & Restaurant Supply 72.00 8.53 a 12.22 a 3.30 a
Meridian, MS Y Y Y
International Rest. Dist. 54.96 10.25 14.80 4.44
Apopka, FL
Johnson-Lancaster 3.80 6.93 a 9.97 a 2.68 a
Clearwater, FL 45.60 u Y u
Pueblo Hotel Supply 6.02 8.99 13.10 3.89
Pueblo, CO 72.24
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tampa, FL
Sam Tell & Son 42.96 9.07 13.22 2.59
Farmingdale, NY
Supreme Paper Supplies 68.84 6.80 a,Y 9.78 a,Y 2.63 a,u
Pensacola, FL 5.45 a,u 7.76 a,u 1.74 a,Y

Not Awarded

ITEM Covers, Plastic Covers, Plastic
Full-Size 1/2 Size 1/6 Size

Quantity: 20 ea 20 ea 20 ea 50 ea
0799273 0799274 0799274 0799253 N

ITEM NUMBER 65 66 67 68
Calico Industries 5.98 3.88 3.12 10.13 N
Longwood, FL Y
Culinary Depot 9.09 5.10 3.76 15.28 N
Monsey, NY u
Hotel & Restaurant Supply 5.35 a 3.65 2.15 13.40 N
Meridian, MS Y Y Y Y
International Rest. Dist. 10.35 5.80 4.30 21.00 N
Apopka, FL Y
Johnson-Lancaster 6.48 a 3.43 a 1.92 a 10.93 N
Clearwater, FL u u Y
Pueblo Hotel Supply 9.09 5.10 3.76 22.44 N
Pueblo, CO u
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tampa, FL
Sam Tell & Son 6.42 5.14 3.79 11.96 N
Farmingdale, NY Y
Supreme Paper Supplies 6.24 a,Y 3.31 a 1.85 a,Y 10.73 N
Pensacola, FL 4.71 a,Y Y 0.81 a,Y Y

Cover must match pan, item awarded matches pan

Storage Boxes
Covers, Plastic Lid for Full Size

6 Compartment

Page 9



ITEM Teaspoon, Fork Measuring Colander
Flatware Flatware Spoon Set

Quantity: 20 dz 20 dz 20 set 20 ea
0710560 0710550 0730280 0799101

ITEM NUMBER 69 70 71 72 N
Calico Industries 1.03 Y 1.45 Y 0.51 17.88 N
Longwood, FL u
Culinary Depot 1.41 2.34 0.53 No Bid
Monsey, NY
Hotel & Restaurant Supply 0.95 1.50 0.50 38.50 N,u
Meridian, MS m
International Rest. Dist. 1.20 1.60 0.75 49.90 N
Apopka, FL Y
Johnson-Lancaster 0.96 a 1.35 a 1.29 a 33.94 N
Clearwater, FL Y Y Y u
Pueblo Hotel Supply 1.41 2.34 2.88 a No Bid
Pueblo, CO u
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tampa, FL
Sam Tell & Son 1.24 2.06 0.52 a 18.84 N
Farmingdale, NY u u
Supreme Paper Supplies 0.95 a 1.35 a 0.42 a No Bid
Pensacola, FL Y Y Y

ITEM Funnel Tomato Corer
6" #6 #8

Quantity: 10 ea 10 ea 10 ea 50 ea
0799093 0799023 0740360 0740370

ITEM NUMBER 73 74 75 76
Calico Industries 24.46 2.08 a 4.71 a 4.71 a
Longwood, FL u u u
Culinary Depot 23.38 1.22 u 6.95 6.95
Monsey, NY
Hotel & Restaurant Supply 23.80 m 2.45 a 6.77 6.76
Meridian, MS u
International Rest. Dist. 24.00 3.50 7.44 7.44
Apopka, FL
Johnson-Lancaster 23.59 2.85 a 6.27 a 6.27 a
Clearwater, FL u Y Y
Pueblo Hotel Supply 23.87 2.70 a 7.00 7.00
Pueblo, CO u
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tampa, FL
Sam Tell & Son 23.59 1.07 a 6.40 a 6.38 a
Farmingdale, NY u u u
Supreme Paper Supplies 4.26 a 1.22 a 4.79 a 4.79 a
Pensacola, FL Y u Y Y

Scoops, Serving

24 Qt. Capacity

Scoops, Serving
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ITEM
#10 #12 #16 Manual

Quantity: 10 ea 10 ea 10 ea 5 ea
0740380 0740390 0740400 0740100

ITEM NUMBER 77 78 79 80
Calico Industries 4.71 a 4.71 a 4.71 a 245.91
Longwood, FL u u u
Culinary Depot 6.95 6.95 6.95 178.29
Monsey, NY
Hotel & Restaurant Supply 6.77 6.77 6.75 173.00
Meridian, MS
International Rest. Dist. 7.44 7.44 7.44 192.00
Apopka, FL
Johnson-Lancaster 6.27 a 6.27 a 6.27 a 175.37
Clearwater, FL Y Y Y
Pueblo Hotel Supply 7.00 7.00 7.00 178.28
Pueblo, CO
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tampa, FL
Sam Tell & Son 6.38 a 6.38 a 6.38 a 177.50
Farmingdale, NY u u u
Supreme Paper Supplies 4.79 a 4.79 a 4.79 a 196.40
Pensacola, FL Y Y Y

ITEM Can Opener Spoon Spoodle, 2 oz.
Electric Three Sided Perforated 22 Gallon

Quantity: 20 ea 10 ea 10 ea 15 ea
0740101 N 0730030 0739510 0799257 N

ITEM NUMBER 81 82 83 84
Calico Industries 594.81 N 1.98 1.16 a 48.22 N
Longwood, FL Y Y Y
Culinary Depot 1,220.85 N 1.19 1.07 56.86 N
Monsey, NY u Y
Hotel & Restaurant Supply 1,180.00 N 1.20 0.90 a 48.50 N
Meridian, MS u Y Y
International Rest. Dist. 598.00 N 3.32 a 3.32 75.00 N
Apopka, FL Y u Y
Johnson-Lancaster 548.45 N 6.46 a 6.71 44.12 N
Clearwater, FL Y u Y
Pueblo Hotel Supply 568.49 N 6.57 a 6.80 15.85 N
Pueblo, CO Y u u
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tampa, FL
Sam Tell & Son 546.00 N 1.49 6.40 a 51.20 N
Farmingdale, NY u u Y
Supreme Paper Supplies 1,295.50 N No Bid 0.96 a 38.69 N
Pensacola, FL u u Y

Scoops, Serving Scoops, Serving Scoops, Serving Can Opener

Food Storage Box
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ITEM Measure Thermometer
13 Gallon Liquid, 1 qt. 12 oz. Food Check

Quantity: 15 ea 25 ea 15 ea 25 ea
0799258 N 0799034 0770200 0750410

ITEM NUMBER 85 86 87 88
Calico Industries 37.04 N 6.68 0.48 7.18
Longwood, FL Y
Culinary Depot 43.32 N 6.66 0.52 8.51
Monsey, NY Y
Hotel & Restaurant Supply 33.75 N 6.47 1.05 a 8.28
Meridian, MS Y Y
International Rest. Dist. 52.00 N 7.10 0.65 8.75
Apopka, FL Y
Johnson-Lancaster 30.70 N 6.60 0.52 a 8.26
Clearwater, FL Y 3.10 Y
Pueblo Hotel Supply 45.15 N 6.66 1.07 a 6.80
Pueblo, CO Y u
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tampa, FL
Sam Tell & Son 38.86 N 6.10 0.47 a 6.87
Farmingdale, NY Y u
Supreme Paper Supplies 26.99 N 3.03 a 0.37 a 1.82 a
Pensacola, FL Y Y Y Y

ITEM Thermometer Thermometer Broom Head
Oven Freezer/Frig 18"

Quantity: 5 ea 25 ea 30 ea 15 ea
0750421 0750440 0750420 0799306

ITEM NUMBER 89 90 91 92
Calico Industries 13.13 6.77 1.84 a 4.34
Longwood, FL u
Culinary Depot 15.55 8.02 No Bid 8.99
Monsey, NY
Hotel & Restaurant Supply 15.12 7.78 2.45 a 9.00
Meridian, MS Y
International Rest. Dist. 17.00 9.15 2.75 a 13.30 a
Apopka, FL Y u
Johnson-Lancaster 15.11 7.79 1.86 a No Bid
Clearwater, FL Y
Pueblo Hotel Supply 12.44 6.42 1.93 a 10.55
Pueblo, CO u
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.99 a
Tampa, FL u
Sam Tell & Son 12.95 a 8.09 1.63 a 6.36
Farmingdale, NY Y u
Supreme Paper Supplies 5.99 a No Bid No Bid 6.83
Pensacola, FL Y

Food Storage Box Squeeze Bottle

Thermometer
Food Ch. Digital
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ITEM Broom
Handle

Quantity: 15 ea 25 ea 25 ea 25 ea
0799308 0799062 0799066 0799091

ITEM NUMBER 93 94 95 96
Calico Industries 1.73 18.83 15.60 23.55
Longwood, FL
Culinary Depot No Bid 16.09 15.95 22.31
Monsey, NY
Hotel & Restaurant Supply 3.15 21.60 m 14.40 m 21.70 m
Meridian, MS
International Rest. Dist. 3.94 16.72 10.60 22.18 a
Apopka, FL u
Johnson-Lancaster No Bid 13.62 a 7.96 a 8.87 a
Clearwater, FL Y Y Y
Pueblo Hotel Supply 3.39 21.86 a 13.94 a 22.31
Pueblo, CO Y Y
Pyramid School Products 1.99 a No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tampa, FL u
Sam Tell & Son 3.59 20.13 13.36 27.68
Farmingdale, NY
Supreme Paper Supplies 3.37 20.85 aY 13.30 a,Y 9.01 a
Pensacola, FL 13.83 aY 8.09 a,Y Y

ITEM Dolly

Quantity: 25 ea 25 ea 15 ea 15 ea
0780022 0788022 0780024 0799700

ITEM NUMBER 97 98 N 99 100

Calico Industries 14.20 26.50 N 19.37 72.26
Longwood, FL Y
Culinary Depot 13.58 25.33 N 18.51 81.89
Monsey, NY Y
Hotel & Restaurant Supply 15.50 28.95 N 21.20 79.60
Meridian, MS Y
International Rest. Dist. 14.75 26.00 N 21.16 89.90
Apopka, FL u
Johnson-Lancaster 13.67 25.51 N 21.93 No Bid
Clearwater, FL Y
Pueblo Hotel Supply 5.39 a 9.97 N 7.35 a 81.89
Pueblo, CO u u u
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid 89.98
Tampa, FL
Sam Tell & Son 19.71 26.96 19.71 102.36
Farmingdale, NY
Supreme Paper Supplies 15.34 a 24.90 N 16.84 a 20.96 a
Pensacola, FL u u u u

Pan, Steam Table
Half-Long, Stainless

Half-Size, Blk Poly Full-Size, Blk Poly Half-Long, Blk Poly
Pan, Steam Table Pan, Steam Table Pan, Steam Table

Full Size, Stainless Half-Size, Stainless
Pan, Steam Table Pan, Steam Table
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ITEM Mop Wringers Dust Pan Wet Floor
Floor Sign

Quantity: 15 ea 15 ea 15 ea 15 ea
0751000 0751010 0799300 0799600

ITEM NUMBER 101 102 103 104
Calico Industries 35.98 33.69 23.62 4.94
Longwood, FL
Culinary Depot 50.10 89.77 No Bid 10.55
Monsey, NY
Hotel & Restaurant Supply 48.70 87.25 30.65 a 10.26
Meridian, MS u
International Rest. Dist. 43.00 75.80 28.00 a 14.96
Apopka, FL u
Johnson-Lancaster 49.64 64.90 No Bid 10.45
Clearwater, FL
Pueblo Hotel Supply 43.20 a 40.71 a 25.45 a 6.39 a
Pueblo, CO u u u u
Pyramid School Products 19.98 a 19.98 a 2.98 u 5.99 a
Tampa, FL u u u
Sam Tell & Son 57.99 75.81 17.91 8.50
Farmingdale, NY
Supreme Paper Supplies 27.60 a 26.40 No Bid 6.39 a,u
Pensacola, FL u 4.95 a,Y

ITEM Utility Cart Floor Squeegee Mop Handle for 
3 Shelf 5" Mop Head

Quantity: 5 ea 10 ea 10 ea 10 ea
0751001 0751011 0751013 0751012 N

ITEM NUMBER 105 106 107 108
Calico Industries 188.00 8.22 3.84 a 10.73 N
Longwood, FL Y Y
Culinary Depot 139.43 a 10.91 4.78 9.82 N
Monsey, NY u u
Hotel & Restaurant Supply 181.00 a 24.50 4.65 9.55 N
Meridian, MS u u
International Rest. Dist. 275.00 17.00 5.46 11.82 N
Apopka, FL u
Johnson-Lancaster 139.51 13.82 4.78 9.82 N
Clearwater, FL u
Pueblo Hotel Supply 158.31 a 11.03 4.78 12.73 N
Pueblo, CO u u
Pyramid School Products 99.95 a No Bid 5.59 5.59 N
Tampa, FL u u
Sam Tell & Son 149.95 12.63 5.54 11.36 N
Farmingdale, NY u
Supreme Paper Supplies No Bid 22.60 4.52 a 8.60 a
Pensacola, FL Y Y

Not Awarded

N - No prior approved brand - samples required
a = Alternate bid 
m = Vendor bid minimum shipment
p = Pack size not acceptable
u = Unacceptable, no sample sent or sample not approved
y = Sample received and approved

Mop Buckets

Mop Floor Head

101 to 102 Awarded as a lot
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BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST
Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the Purchasing 
Department Office and are also posted to the School District's website address at: 
http://old.escambia.k12.fl.us/adminoff/finance/purchasing/current_bid_activity.html

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in
Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes, and School Board Rules shall constitute a waiver of proceedings.
Bid tabulations or recommendations will be distributed solely through the Purchasing 
website address.  Notices will not be automatically mailed.

I hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and have been received
in compliance to Escambia County School Board Rules and Florida Law.

John Dombroskie, Director
Purchasing Department
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